Ozark Pest Bodine's Pest Orkin Pest Control Terminex Schendell Pest Services Heartland Pied Piper Lawrence Pest Control
Pest & Rodent Control Services - 137594
File #221 Bid Date 06/10/09
. Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Total For Price Per Price Per Total For
ltem # Location Month Total For Year Month Total For Year Month Total For Year Month Total For Year Month Year Month Total For Year Month Year

1 Municipal Building & TPAC 30.00 360.000 45.00 540.000 99.00 1,188.000 50.00 600.000 55.00 660.000 37.50 450.000 40.00 480.000

Administrative Offices

Law Enforcement Center
2 Suite 100 30.00 360.000 28.00 336.000 79.00 948.000 42.00 504.000 22.00 264.000 37.50 450.000 40.00 480.000

Law Enforcement Center
3 Suite 200 30.00 360.000 28.00 336.000 79.00 948.000 42.00 504.000 22.00 264.000 37.50 450.000 40.00 480.000
4 Impound Lot 10.00 120.000 10.00 120.000 69.00 828.000 39.00 468.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 40.00 480.000
5 Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Delted
6 Fire Academy 20.00 240.000 20.00 240.000 59.00 708.000 32.00 384.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
7 Fire Station #1 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
8 Fire Station #2 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
9 Fire Station #3 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
10 Fire Station #4 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
11 Fire Station #5 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
12 Fire Station #6 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
13 Fire Station #7 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000




14 Fire Station #8 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
15 Fire Station #9 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
16 Fire Station #10 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
17 Fire Station #11 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 89.00 1,068.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
18 Fire Station #12 15.00 180.000 20.00 240.000 59.00 708.000 22.50 270.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 20.00 240.000
NTWWTP Headwork's
19 Building 30.00 360.000 33.00 396.000 49.00 588.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
20 NTWWTP Blower Building 25.00 300.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
21 NTWWTP Clarifier Building 10.00 120.000 10.00 120.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
22 NTWWTP Carpenter Shop 10.00 120.000 15.00 180.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
NTWWTP Administration
23 Building 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
24 NTWWTP Pump Storage 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
25 NTWWTP Building NT-1 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
26 NTWWTP Solids 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
27 NTWWTP NT-6 10.00 120.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
28 NTWWTP NT-15 10.00 120.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
29 NTWWTP NT-11 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
30 NTWWTP NT-3 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid




31 NTWWTP NT-13 10.00 120.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
32 NTWWTP NT-10 10.00 120.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 15.00 180.000 9.00 108.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
33 OWWTP Building "A" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
34 OWWTP Building "B" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
35 OWWTP Building "D" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
36 OWWTP Building "E" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
37 OWWTP Building "O" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
38 OWWTP Building "Q" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
39 OWWTP Building "T" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
40 OWWTP Building "U" 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 49.00 588.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
41 OWWTP Clarifier Building 10.00 120.000 15.00 180.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
42 OWWTP PEW Building 10.00 120.000 15.00 180.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 No Bid No Bid
43 OWWTP UV Building 10.00 120.000 15.00 180.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
OWWTP Headworks
44 Building 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 20.00 240.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
OWWTP Sludge Handling
45 Building 10.00 120.000 15.00 180.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
46 OWWTP Tunnels (2 each) 20.00 240.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
47 OWWTP BIO Building 10.00 120.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000




48 OWWTP Collection Building 20.00 240.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000

49 OWWTP Building "S" 10.00 120.000 25.00 300.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000

50 OWWTP Boiler Building 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000

51 OWWTP GHI Building 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000

52 OWWTP Building "M" 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000

53 OWWTP Building "R" 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
OWWTP Second Clarifier

54 Building 10.00 120.000 20.00 240.000 19.00 228.000 14.00 168.000 13.00 156.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
Abbott Community Ctr 1112

55 E 10th Upper Lvl. 20.00 240.000 35.00 420.000 49.00 588.000 20.00 240.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
Abbott Community Ctr 114 E

56 10th Lower Lvl. 20.00 240.000 35.00 420.000 49.00 588.000 25.00 300.000 15.00 180.000 37.50 450.000 10.00 120.000
TPAC exterior-power spray 37500

57 April or May No Charge No Charge 110.00 110.000 299.00 299.000 100.00 100.000 55.00 55.000 37.50 ] 30.00 30.000
TPAC exterior-power spray 37 500

58 July No Charge No Charge 110.00 110.000 299.00 299.000 100.00 100.000 55.00 55.000 37.50 ] 30.00 30.000

Grand Total 10,260.000 14,968.000 27,778.000 12,656.000 9,206.000 24,825.000 7,500.000




