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1) Havis C-VX-2400-CHGR (*Exception) NO BID
Make Havis Havis Havis Shield Havis Havis
Model C-VS-2400-CJGR As listed* As listed As listed* As requested

Price Each 766.44 710.80 705.65 748.00 640.00

Extension (6 Each) 4,598.64 - 4,264.80 4,233.90 4,488.00 3,840.00

2) Jotto Desk 425-6406 NO BID
Make Jotto Desk Jotto Desk Jotto Desk Jotto Desk Jotto Desk
Model 425-6406 As listed As listed As listed As requested

Price Each 515.00 521.80 575.50 359.90 395.00

Extension (4 Each) - 2,060.00 2,087.20 2,302.00 1,439.60 1,580.00

3) Havis C-AS-1025 NO BID
Make Havis Havis Havis Shield Havis Havis
Model C-AS-1025 As listed As listed As listed* As requested

Price Each 567.49 479.80 505.75 493.00 420.00

Extension (2 Each) 1,134.98 - 959.60 1,011.50 986.00 840.00

4) Gamber Johnson 7160-0018 NO BID
Make Gamber Johnson Not listed G. Johnson G. Johnson Havis
Model 7160-0018 TT56C06 As listed As listed C-TTB-CHGR-2

Price Each 329.79 199.95 374.50 312.50 220.00

Extension (10 Each) 3,297.90 - 1,999.50 3,745.00 3,125.00 2,200.00

5) Patriot PB-DCR NO BID NO BID NO BID
Make Not listed Patriot Patriot
Model 5075 PB-DCR PB-DCR

Price Each 375.00 302.25 248.00

Extension (6 Each) - - 2,250.00 1,813.50 1,488.00 -
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6) Patriot PB-SUV-XX NO BID NO BID NO BID
Make Go Rhino Satina Satina
Model 3160B PB-400-TH PB400

Price Each 375.00 319.20 289.00

Extension (1 Each) - - 375.00 319.20 289.00 -

7) Havis C-3190-F NO BID
Make Havis Havis Havis Shield Havis Havis
Model C-3190-F C-3190-F As listed As listed As requested

Price Each 349.22 52.95 406.25 364.00 290.00

Extension (2 Each) 698.44 - 105.90 812.50 728.00 580.00

8) Patriot GR10-1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Make Not listed Patriot Patriot
Model G5500S GR10-1 GR-10-1

Price Each 249.95 279.65 229.00

Extension (6 Each) - - 1,499.70 1,677.90 1,374.00 -

9) Havis C-1200LP (*Exception) NO BID
Make Havis Havis Havis Shield Havis Havis
Model C-1200LP As listed* As listed As listed* As requested

Price Each 328.91 282.95 375.25 369.00 295.00

Extension (1 Lot) 328.91 - 282.95 375.25 369.00 295.00

Days to Delivery 10 - 14 20 - 30 Not listed 60 30 30 - 45
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Exceptions None listed 4) Alternate

3) C-TM-CV
1) CM002124

not listed
9) C-3065-3

not listed

6) Setina alt.
& choice of
HS alum. or

steel
9) C-1200LP
not listed -

typo?

1)*CM002124 not
found/included

9)*CM001214 not
found/included

Alternate
brands not

listed

Item #6
"Patriot does
not make this

bar Satina
does."

1) C-CUP2-I
alt. C-CH2-XL
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