Iltem: Section Il Uniforms
Date: August 28, 2009 Buyer: Teri CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

Department: Police

Bid # PD-129-09 File # 294

VENDORS
Description of Iltems Southern
Uniform & Equip Jays Alamar PDQ Galls US Cavalry OMB
Duty Coat 104.50 112.62 106.88 99.99
Rain Coat 99.23 103.73 101.48 114.00
Parka 140.03 146.97 203.05 234.20
Safety Vests 43.24 48.97 44.00 45.50
Ties 3.46 5.30 4.55 7.99 5.99 26.00
Trouser Belts 12.95 14.95 10.00 16.75 9.85
Socks 1.99 3.97 3.50 No bid 2.49
Gloves 20.38 31.97 19.50 28.99 17.49 14.72
Stocking Cap 16.11 19.95 17.00 18.00
Turtleneck 26.95 34.95 26.25 28.95
Mock Turtleneck 26.95 27.95 26.25 28.95
Dickeys 9.95 13.96 11.50 10.99
V-Neck Sweaters 45.33 56.28 50.50 51.00
BDU Pants 31.11 No bid 28.90 No bid 35.99 30.99 30.75
Short Sleeve Shirts 30.00 No bid 37.18 No bid 35.99 30.99 36.99
Long Sleeve Shirts 32.22 No bid 38.98 No bid 35.99 31.99 36.99
Polo Shirt 27.78 No bid 35.50 No bid 35.99 28.49 29.75
Knit Shirt 39.00 39.97 37.87 No bid No bid
Shorts 26.67 No bid 24.60 No bid 24.74 26.49 26.25
Customization (Back) 3.85 No bid 10.00 No bid 5.99
Customization (Riot Bag) 3.85 No bid 10.00 No bid 5.99
Customization (Name Tags) Al l)2id5104.36 No bid 4.50 No bid 1.49
Motorcycle Duty Coat 136.03 124.43 127.38 137.41
Motorcycle Rain Coat 118.74 109.97 106.27 118.06
PDU Class B Cargo Pant 38.08 No bid 37.18 No bid 37.25
PDU Class B Short Sleeve Shirt 38.08 No bid 37.18 No bid 37.25
PDU Class B Long Sleeve Shirt 38.08 No bid 37.18 No bid 37.25




Total

20,158.37

9,999.90

22,503.80

13,032.80

6,666.75

7,644.35

8,810.75




