
Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price Brand Reorder # Case Price

1
TOILET TISSUE: White toilet tissue, single roll, 
4.5”x3.75” 2-ply.  SCA TM1616S
Container Size: 500 sheets/roll – 96 rolls per case

NO BID As Specified 5380089           37.28 As Specified 32.24       NO BID As Specified 34.30          NO BID NO BID As Specified 53.88         

2

TOILET TISSUE: Continuous 1-ply white toilet tissue,
3.55”x2000’ roll, perforated. To fit Molnlyke T-Tork
dispensers.  SCA TJ0912A.
Container size: 12 rolls per case

NO BID As Specified 2255931           30.25 As Specified 26.21       NO BID As Specified 27.80          NO BID NO BID As Specified 44.46         

3
TOILET SEAT COVERS: 10”x15”, flushable, 1/2-fold, 
Hospital Specialty Company SP-5000.
Container Size: 250/pack, 20 packs/case

NO BID As Specified 2255555        36.10 As Specified 64.46         NO BID As Specified 39.75          NO BID NO BID HOS
HG-5000 59.76         

4
FACIAL TISSUE: White, 2-ply, open size – 8.2”x7.9”
SCA TF 6710A
Container Size: 100 per box, 30 boxes/case

NO BID As Specified 5088543           19.75 As Specified 17.44       NO BID As Specified 18.15          NO BID NO BID As Specified 28.90         

5
PAPER TOWELS: Multi-folded, absorbent, 30 lb. Kraft,
soft embossed towels, 9.5”x9.125” SCA MK530A natural
Container Size: 16 packages per case

NO BID As Specified 5235986           16.67 As Specified 14.39       NO BID As Specified 14.75          NO BID NO BID As Specified 26.11         

6
PAPER TOWELS: Same as #5: bleached.
SCA MB540A bleached
Container Size: 16 packages per case

NO BID As Specified 5235984           19.01 As Specified 16.94       NO BID As Specified 17.48          NO BID NO BID As Specified 26.31         

7
PAPER TOWELS: C-folded, bleached only,
12.75”x10.125” SCA CB530 bleached
Container Size: 16 packages per case

NO BID As Specified 5048674           19.21 As Specified 15.63       NO BID As Specified 16.74          NO BID NO BID As Specified 33.94         

8
PAPER TOWELS: Single-fold, bleached only
10.25”x10.125” SCA SB1840A bleached
Container Size: 16 packages per case

NO BID As Specified 5257572           21.73 As Specified 18.64       NO BID As Specified 20.00          NO BID NO BID As Specified 33.37         

9
PAPER TOWELS: Folded shop wipes, absorbent for
hand and tool wiping, 12.5”x13” WYPALL L30 05812
Container Size: 1,080 per case

As Specified 09867477 40.63         As Specified 2177662           41.78 K05412 41.41       NO BID SCA 192136 52.50          NO BID NO BID As Specified 44.08         

10
PAPER TOWELS: Folded, absorbent, windshield
cleaning wipes 10”x10.8” WYPALL L30 03086
Container Size: 1,200 per case

As Specified 89805816 52.24         As Specified 5234414           55.22 K03086 54.74         NO BID SCA 192122 30.35          NO BID NO BID As Specified 54.31       

11
PAPER TOWELS: Continuous, non-perforated washroom
roll towels, natural, size 7.85”x350’ SCA RK350A
Container Size: 12 rolls per case

NO BID As Specified 5331363           19.07 As Specified 16.53       NO BID As Specified 17.50          NO BID NO BID As Specified 26.17         

12
PAPER TOWELS: Continous, non-perforated washroom
toll towels, natural, size 8"x800' GPP 89460
Container size: 6 rolls per case

NO BID As Specified 5057610           62.18 As Specified 54.89         NO BID As Specified 54.30        NO BID NO BID NO BID

13

PAPER TOWELS: Continuous 2-ply, center-feed,
bleached, perforated 9”x11.8” towels, SCA 121201
Container Size: 6 rolls per case
Replacement/Change Out of dispenser Universal Type,
State Brand & Model

NO BID As Specified 5037072           34.69 As Specified 29.98       NO BID As Specified 37.30          NO BID NO BID As Specified 50.12         

14

PAPER TOWELS: Super sized, soft, perforated,
embossed roll towels, 84 sheets per roll, sheet size 11” x
9”, 2-ply, SCA HB1990A
Container Size: 30 rolls per case

NO BID As Specified 5280741           22.10 As Specified 19.14       NO BID As Specified 20.30          NO BID NO BID As Specified 32.66         

15
NAPKINS, DISPOSABLE: Paper, 15”x16.25”, 1/8-fold, 2-
ply, white.  SCA NP310A
Container Size: 3,000 per case

NO BID As Specified 5307367           37.65 As Specified 31.94       NO BID As Specified 35.00          NO BID NO BID As Specified 52.69         

16

NAPKINS, DISPOSABLE: Paper, Lip and Finger size for
dispensers. Folded size – 3.5” x 6.75”. Open size
6.5”x13.5”, 1 ply, white, SCA D3052B
Container Size: 10,000 per case

NO BID As Specified 5415495           32.59 As Specified 28.24       NO BID As Specified 30.00          NO BID NO BID As Specified 44.52         

17
CUPS, PAPER, HOT DRINK TYPE: 8-ounce with
handles, Solo 378MH
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 54.39       NO BID SCC
378MH 67.30          NO BID NO BID As Specified 55.47         

18
CUPS, PAPER, HOT DRINK TYPE: 8-ounce without
handles, Solo 378MD
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 50.09         NO BID SC
378W 58.88          NO BID NO BID As Specified 48.24       

19
CUPS, PAPER, CONE-TYPE: 4-ounce, rolled rims, Solo 
SCC 4R
Container Size: 5,000 cups/case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 54.39         NO BID P4388710 68.50          NO BID NO BID SCC 4R 41.11       

20
CUPS, PAPER, COLD DRINK TYPE: 16-ounce rolled
rims.  Solo SCC RW16
Container Size: 1,000 cups/case

NO BID NO BID SORW19-
00055 58.59       NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID As Specified 58.81         

21
PLATES, DISPOSABLE: 6” coated paper, for hot or cold
food service, Solo SCC 6BPMD
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 44.05       NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID

22
PLATES, DISPOSABLE: 9” coated paper, for hot or cold
food service, Solo SCC 9PMD
Container Size: 500 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 35.19       NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID As Specified 71.33         

23
BOWLS, DISPOSABLE: 12-ounce coated paper, for hot
or cold food service, Solo SCC 12SBD (Next time: HWB12-2050)

Container Size: 1,000 per case
NO BID NO BID DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID
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24
FLATWARE, DISPOSABLE: Forks, white plastic for hot
and cold food service.  Dixie DXEFM207
Container Size: 100 per box

NO BID NO BID As Specified 9.90         NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 1,000/cs DIX
FM207 43.72         

25
FLATWARE, DISPOSABLE: Same as above except
spoons.  Dixie DXESM207
Container Size: 100 per box

NO BID NO BID As Specified 9.90         NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 1,000/cs DIX
SM207 73.72         

26
FLATWARE, DISPOSABLE: Same as above except
knives.  Dixie DXEKM207
Container Size: 100 per box

NO BID NO BID As Specified 9.90         NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 1,000/cs DIX
KM207 73.72         

27
PADS, FEMININE HYGIENE: Flat – StayFree Maxi #8, 
classic maxi pad napkins, packaged for vending
Container Size: 250 per case

As Specified 00102186 50.79         As Specified 2028077        30.48 E-248 34.99         Hospeco SM5707 64.00         HSMT8 48.20          NO BID NO BID NO BID

28
PADS, FEMININE HYGIENE: Folded – StayFree #4, 
classic maxi pad napkins, packaged for vending
Container Size: 250 per case

As Specified 00102178 50.62         As Specified 2028079           28.49 4-147 26.99       Hospeco T066 54.00         HSMT4 44.20          NO BID NO BID NO BID

29
TAMPONS, FEMININE HYGIENE: Kotex #1462 tampons 
must be packaged for vending
Container Size: 500 per case

NO BID As Specified 5310729           58.30 T500 54.69       Hospeco T067 69.00         HSMT500 80.50          NO BID NO BID NO BID

30
BAGS, SANITARY NAPKINS: For feminine hygiene
product disposal, Hospital Specialty Company KL-260
Container Size: 500 per case

NO BID As Specified 2028067        13.96 K260 15.90         As Specified 46.00         HS2600 24.95          NO BID NO BID HOS
260 24.31         

31
BAGS, PAPER #1: Brown Kraft grocery type,
3.5”x2.25”x7.5” 80035
Container Size: 8,000 per bale

NO BID NO BID 1NKGR 133.28     NO BID
Only in 

bundle of 
500

P1001050 8.50            NO BID NO BID NO BID

32
BAGS, PAPER #4: Brown Kraft grocery type,
5”x3.125”x9.875” 80037
Container Size: 4,000 per bale

NO BID As Specified 5275819        50.83 4NKGR 71.40         NO BID
Only in 

bundle of 
500

P1001200 10.70          NO BID NO BID NO BID

33
BAGS, PAPER #16: Brown Kraft grocery type,
7.625”x4.875”x16.25” 80044
Container Size: 1,000 per bale

NO BID As Specified 5275829        29.06 16NKGR 45.58         NO BID
Only in 

bundle of 
500

P1001500 22.60          NO BID NO BID NO BID

34
BAGS, PAPER 1/6 Barrel: Brown Kraft grocery type,
12”x7”x17 1/6”
Container Size: 500 per bale

NO BID As Specified 5276044        28.21 1/6-1257 39.80         NO BID
Only in 

bundle of 
500

P1163600 41.80          NO BID NO BID NO BID

35

GLOVES, POWDER FREE LATEX, EXAM &
CLEANING: 9.5 inches long, at least ASTM .08mm palm
and finger thickness with textured fingers in Medium,
Large and Extra Large sizes. Microflex Diamond Grip
MF-300 or equal.
Container Size: 100 per box/10 boxes per case

NO BID NO BID IP8622-XX 58.00       NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID

36

GLOVES, POWDER FREE LATEX, GENERAL
PURPOSE: 9.5 inches long, at least ASTM .08mm palm
and finger thickness – large size only, Safety Today
#61075LG
Container Size: 100 per box/10 boxes per case

NO BID As Specified 5075872        31.27 IP8625L 34.90         NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID

37

TRASHCAN LINERS: 7.5 – 10-gallon capacity, regular-
duty, linear low-density, 20” X 21” clear
Pitt Plastics P-2210-C
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID As Specified 5063229           12.58 As Specified 12.54       NO BID As Specified 13.50          AAP  2021L1 21.54         CPC 14.40         NO BID

38

TRASHCAN LINERS: 7.5 – 10-gallon capacity, regular-
duty, linear low-density, 20”x21” buff
Pitt Plastics P-2410-DB
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 16.44       NO BID As Specified 17.80          AAP  2021L1B 22.38         CPC 16.20         NO BID

39

TRASHCAN LINERS: 12 – 16-gallon capacity, regular-
duty bags, linear low-density, 24”x32” clear
Pitt Plastics P-3310-DC
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 22.94       NO BID As Specified 24.80          AAP  2432L1C 19.69         CPC 19.10         NO BID

40

TRASHCAN LINERS: 12 – 16-gallon capacity, regular-
duty, linear low-density, 24”x32” buff
Pitt Plastics P-3310-DB
Container Size: 1,000 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 22.94       NO BID As Specified 24.80          AAP  2432L1B 19.69         CPC 23.10         NO BID

41

TRASHCAN LINERS: 20 – 30-gallon capacity, medium-
duty, linear low-density, 30”x36” clear
Pitt Plastics P-3715-C
Container Size: 250 per case

NO BID As Specified 2110587           11.56 As Specified 11.54       NO BID As Specified 11.70          AAP  3036L14C 17.96         CPC 19.10         NO BID

42

TRASHCAN LINERS: 20 – 30-gallon capacity, medium-
duty, linear low-density, 30”x36” buff
Pitt Plastics P-3715-B
Container Size: 250 per case

NO BID As Specified 2138452           12.72 As Specified 12.54       NO BID As Specified 12.80          AAP  3036L14B 17.96         CPC 21.80         NO BID

43

TRASHCAN LINERS: 20 – 30-gallon capacity, extra-extra
heavy-duty, linear low-density, 30”x36” black
Pitt Plastics TM-37-T
Container Size: 125 per case

NO BID 250 Per 
Case 5210165           19.17 As Specified 16.09       NO BID As Specified 17.40          AAP  3036L15B 9.97           CPC 17.20         NO BID
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44

TRASHCAN LINERS: 26-gallon capacity, extra heavy-
duty, Slim Jim, linear low-density, 33”x40” Shark Skin
Gray
Pitt Plastics RX-294-XG
Container Size: 100 per case

NO BID As Specified 5063236           11.17 As Specified 10.39       NO BID As Specified 11.28          AAP  3340L15G 8.30           CPC 13.10         NO BID

45

TRASHCAN LINERS: 33-gallon capacity, medium-duty
bag, linear low-density, 33”x39” buff
Pitt Plastics P-4015-B
Container Size: 250 per case

NO BID As Specified 2138457           14.57 As Specified 14.14       NO BID As Specified 14.75          AAP  3339L15B 23.79         CPC 21.10         NO BID

46

TRASHCAN LINERS: 33-gallon capacity, super heavy-
duty, linear low-density, 33”x39” black
Pitt Plastics TM-40-T
Container Size: 125 per case

NO BID As Specified 5210168           18.52 As Specified 16.39       NO BID As Specified 18.70          AAP  3339L15B 9.63           CPC 15.40         NO BID

47

TRASHCAN LINERS: 40 – 50-gallon capacity, heavy-
duty, linear low-density, 40" X 48” buff
Pitt Plastics P-4820-B
Container Size: 50 (125) per case

NO BID As Specified 2138443           14.20 As Specified 13.79       NO BID As Specified 14.30          AAP  4048L15B 7.08           CPC 13.20         NO BID

48

TRASHCAN LINERS: 40 – 50-gallon capacity, extra
heavy-duty bag, linear low-density, 40”x46” black
Pitt Plastics B-74830-K
Container Size: 100 per case

NO BID As Specified 5092385           14.44 As Specified 13.94       NO BID As Specified 14.50          AAP  4046L18B 13.23         CPC 17.40         NO BID

49

TRASHCAN LINERS: 55-gallon capacity, medium-duty,
linear low-density, 36”x58” clear
Pitt Plastics P-6015-C
Container Size: 100 per case

NO BID NO BID As Specified 8.54         NO BID As Specified 8.68            AAP  3658L18C 18.52         CPC 20.80         NO BID

50

TRASHCAN LINERS: 55-gallon capacity, medium-duty,
linear low-density, 38”x58” buff
Pitt Plastics P-6015-B
Container Size: 100 per case

NO BID As Specified 2138432             9.51 As Specified 9.44         NO BID As Specified 10.25          AAP  3858L18B 19.55         CPC 20.40         NO BID

51

TRASHCAN LINERS: 55-gallon capacity, extra-extra
heavy-duty, linear low-density, 36”x58” black.
Pitt Plastics TM-60-T
Container Size: 50 per case

NO BID As Specified 5210172           15.47 As Specified 14.98       NO BID As Specified 15.60          AAP  3658L18B 7.50           CPC 19.20         NO BID

52

TRASHCAN LINERS: 60-gallon capacity, extra-extra
heavy-duty, linear low density, 38"x58” black
Pitt Plastics TM-65-T
Container Size: 50 per case

NO BID As Specified 5210174           16.32 As Specified 15.84       NO BID As Specified 16.48          AAP  3858L18B 7.91           CPC 21.10         NO BID
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All American Poly - New Jersey Applied Industrial Tech. - Topeka KSCentral Poly Corp. - New Jersey

VENDORS
Item Description MCS Direct - Lenexa KS Clayton Paper - St. Joseph MO ICS - Waco TX

Contracts and Procurement
Pisposable Paper and Plastics Bid Tab

Bid #PU-064-09; File #205; Dated Tuesday, June 23, 2009

# MASSCO, Inc. - Wichita KSxpedx - Lenexa KS

REORDER CONTACT INFORMATION
Contact Name
Phone
Fax
Email
Office Hours
Website

Additional information if necessary

Can deliver any size order?
Multiple ship/bill to addresses?
Order by phone/fax/email/website with P-Card or PO?
Delivery within two (2) days?
Inside delivery at no charge?
Holiday delivery policy included?
Contact information included?
Contractual Provisions & Statement of Agreement included
Samples included if other than listed?

Exceptions
Not brand listed / no website / 

delivery time too long

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes
Not by website

5 to 20
Yes

None Required

Zeke Rosenwasser
732.752.3200 X 1124

732.7523261
aeke@allampoly.com

9:00 AM - 5:00 PM EST
N/A

None listed

Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes

Brad Zimmerman
800.777.2773/316.942.9494  X 125

316.942.2335
b.zimmerman@masscomail.comicswacommarkum@hotmail.com

Not Listed

Yes Yes

bids@centralpoly.com
8:00 AM - 5:00 PM
www.massco.com

Yes
Yes
Yes

You can order other items. Not from 
this contract.

232.5508 Cell: 402.699.3542
235.3816

sc0471@applied.com
8:00 AM - 5:00 PM

Attached

908.862.8580
908.862.9019

Amanda LongBecei Binkley Jim Clayton Michelle Markum Andrew Hoffer

www.applied.com

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes Yes

Yes
Yes

No
Yes

No
Yes Yes Yes

www.mscdirect.com

Yes
Yes
Yes

913.438.6300
913.438.6309

binkleyb@mscdirect.com
8:00 to 5:00

Yes
N/A

800.346.0228
816.342.0086

jimc@claytonpaper.com
8:00 - 5:00 Monday thru Friday

www.claytonpaper.com

Yes
Yes
Yes

www.icswaco.net

Yes

8:00 AM - 5:00 PM

Yes

www.centralpoly.com

Yes
Yes
Yes

Automatic set-up with first order.  Each location can be set-up with own 
password, budget, payments 

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Send email to 
angieo@claytonpaper.com with 1st & 
last name/email/phone/dept/address

Yes

Yes
Yes

None listed
Not brand listed / delivery time 

too long

No

No
Yes
Yes

YesYes
Yes

Yes

None listedNone listedNone listed - only bid 4 items None listed - only bid Feminine 
Hygiene products

Yes
None RequiredN/A

800.524.5427
254.751.0299

Christine Van Dyke
913.397.4032
913.397.4179

christine.vandyke@xpedx.com
Not listed

www.xpedx.com

Contact customer services to be set 
up.

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

N/A

None listed

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
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