9/25/2009

High-Visibility ANSI Compliant Garments
Bid #PU-093-09, File #272, Bid Date: Tuesday, September 22, 2009

D inti flt Vendors

escription ot ftem Strong Group | Fisher Scientific Safeline PDQ Alamar Uniforms
Pocket T-Shirt Make Iron Horse Ergodyne Safeline Game Sportsware Occunomix
Number HT2LS 8289 21112 221R LUX-SSETP2
Price Each 8.71 11.88 10.00 22.00 12.60
Extension 6,097.00 8,316.00 7,000.00 15,400.00 8,820.00
Polo Shirt Make Iron Horse Ergodyne Safeline Game Sportsware Occunomix
Number PGT2LS 8295 21182 2255 LUX SSP2
Price Each 10.02 19.26 12.00 21.00 25.98
Extension 751.50 1,444.50 900.00 1,575.00 1,948.50
Sleeveless T-Shirt Make Iron Horse Safeline
Number SLSHT2LS NO BID 21118 NO BID NO BID
Price Each 7.97 11.00
Extension 2,789.50 0.00 3,850.00 0.00 0.00
Long-Sleeve Work Shirt Make Bulwark Safeline ML Kishigo Med Kap
Number NO BID SMW4HV 21181 P10PLA-U93 |SS14HV-G2-ABC
Price Each 95.63 20.00 27.68 57.97|
Extension 0.00 31,079.75 6,500.00 8,996.00 18,840.25
Pullover Sweat Shirt Make Iron Horse Ergodyne Safeline ML Kishigo Occunomix
Number CSwW2Cs 8397 21105 JS100 LUX-SWTL
Price Each 23.08) 29.49 26.00 23.60 22.14
Extension 3,462.00 4,423.50 3,900.00 3,540.00 3,321.00
Zip-Up Hooded Sweatshirt Make] Iron Horse Carhartt Safeline ML Kishigo Occunomix
Number VSW2LS K260 21106 JS102 LUX-SWTLHZ
Price Each 23.08) 36.36 28.00 27.50 25.08
Extension 1,731.00 2,727.00 2,100.00 2,062.50 1,881.00
All-Season Jacket Make Ergodyne Safeline Spiewak
Number NO BID 8350 21104 NO BID S525V
Price Each 61.31 60.00 90.73)
Extension 0.00 4,598.25 4,500.00 0.00 6,804.75
Cool Mesh Safety Vest Make Iron Horse Ergodyne Safeline Occunomix
Number M2287LSV 820SHL 21116 NO BID LUX-SSGCB
Price Each 7.61 6.19 7.00 13.92
Extension 1,141.50 928.50 1,050.00 0.00 2,088.00
Days to Delivery 15 working Not listed 30 10 - 14 working 21 -28 ARO
Exceptions Based on 1-X Oversizes:

delivery 2X-3X=20% more

4X=30% more

5X=40% more
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Vendors

Description of Item

Artcraft Creative Promo.| Johnston Ind. | Safety Supplies
Pocket T-Shirt Make Occunomix Rainier OK-1 Occumonix
Number 21112 TAL LUX-SSETP2
Price Each 11.94 12.99 11.75 12.93
Extension 8,358.00 9,093.00 8,225.00 9,051.00
Polo Shirt Make Occunomix Rainier Occumonix
Number 21182 NO BID LUX-SSP
Price Each 23.58) 16.99 26.50]
Extension 1,768.50 1,274.25 0.00 1,987.50
Sleeveless T-Shirt Make Rainier
Number NO BID 21118 NO BID NO BID
Price Each 11.99
Extension 0.00 4,196.50 0.00 0.00
Long-Sleeve Work Shirt Make Rainier
Number NO BID 21181 NO BID NO BID
Price Each 19.99
Extension 0.00 6,496.75 0.00 0.00
Pullover Sweat Shirt Make Occunomix Rainier OK-1 Occumonix
Number 21102 5056009 LUX-SWTL
Price Each 20.33 27.99 24.69) 25.53
Extension 3,049.50 4,198.50 3,703.50 3,829.50
Zip-Up Hooded Sweatshirt Make] QOccunomix Rainier OK-1 QOccumonix
Number 21106 5056012 LUX-SWTLH2
Price Each 26.15 29.99 28.22 28.66
Extension 1,961.25 2,249.25 2,116.50 2,149.50
All-Season Jacket Make Occunomix Rainier Occumonix
Number 21104 NO BID LUX-TJBJ
Price Each 58.55) 61.99 65.22
Extension 4,391.25 4,649.25 0.00 4,891.50
Cool Mesh Safety Vest Make Occunomix Rainier OK-1 QOccumonix
Number 21116 AlL LUX-SSGC
Price Each 11.57 8.99 8.18] 11.97
Extension 1,735.50 1,348.50 1,227.00 1,795.50
Days to Delivery 10 28 to 60 71010 3 weeks ARO
Exceptions 12 garments any Oversize Charge | Prices are for S-
style minimum 3X to 5X: XL only
At least 12 #1-12.93 Oversize charges
garments of one #5 - 25.87 are on addendum
style for printing #6 - 29.40 from them
minimum
At least 48
garments of Item
#1 style for
printing minimum
Oversize Charge:
2X or 3X = 10%
3X or 4X = 20%
5X = 50%
6X = 60%
7X = 100%
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